
Camping Stage 3 Assessment   

 

 

 ☐ I know how to care for all my personal gear 

 Scouts need to show an awareness of the value of camping equipment. They should also be 
aware that if it’s not working properly, it is likely to fail in bad weather conditions. A scout should 
demonstrate how to go about checking and caring for equipment.  

Safety implications of poor or faulty equipment  

Keeping personal equipment in working order How to sew 

How to repair items of equipment  

The quality of different items of equipment 

 

☐ I know how to store food on camp 

The Scout should be able to demonstrate and discuss how to go about setting up a store tent or 
organising food. 

storage on a campsite. The Scout should be aware of the use of containers and covers as well as 
an awareness of heat in tents and cold storage locations. 

☐ I can help make a hot drink on the fire 

Scouts should indicate they wish to complete this requirement so that they can be observed in 
action. Safely, attention to detail and awareness of fire, heat and hot liquids should be observed. 

☐ I can help clean up a fireplace after camp  

Scouts should assist other members in the tidying up and the cleaning of a fireplace or 
designated fire lighting area. This will involve the careful disposal of ashes, replacing stones, or 
deconstruction of an altar fire. Leave No trace should be evident; there should be no evidence 
that a fire has been lit in this location after the task is completed (except in a designated fire light 
area on a campsite in that case it should be left in a suitable state for the next campers) 

☐ I know how weather can affect our camp 

The Scout needs to know what to do if it rains or it is very hot, forward thinking and being prepared. 
Explain the different types of weather likely to occur. Explain what will happen if it rains in the 
camp area. Explain what will happen if it is very hot. Explain what extra gear you need to bring – 
just in case 

 

☐ I know why I bring certain gear on camp for our team 

The Scout should show an awareness of the need for general patrol equipment and be able to list 
the main items required and how they differ from personal equipment Tentage – sleeping, dining, 
storage. Storage, First aid, cooking utensils, Tools 



Camping Stage 3 Assessment   

 

☐ I can use a camp tool safely on camp  

Scouts should show how to use a tool correctly and also be aware of any safety implications. Be 
able to use a tool correctly to do the job it was designed for.  

Display your skill in using a particular tool  

Know how to store the tools away for use at another time 

☐ I know how to clean and treat a small cut or scratch  

Scouts need to talk themselves through the process of treatment. This demonstration/talk can 
be done in a practical way on a volunteer  

How to clean the wound  

How to reassure the casualty  

How to apply a bandage. 

☐ I can show a younger member of my Team how to pitch a tent with the help of others  

Scouts should indicate they wish to complete this requirement so that they can be observed in 
action. 

☐ I can assist in the cooking of a meal while on camp  

A Scout should act as an assistant to another more experienced cook. They should assist in 
preparation, cooking and serving of a simple hot meal on camp. The Scout should display 
confidence and basic cooking knowledge. 

☐ I know the main principles of ‘Leave No Trace’  

Scouts should demonstrate an understanding of the key points in a practical way in a camp 
situation Dispose of waste properly. Respect farm animals and wildlife. Minimise the camping 
impact and the effects of fire. Be considerate to others. Travel and camp on durable surfaces. 
Leave what you find. Plan ahead and prepare. 

☐ I can help others to learn about camping  

The Scout should display a willingness to help others learn in a natural way. The Scout should be 
observed in action over a period of time rather than mount a single display of expertise. 

 

☐ Spend at least two consecutive nights on camp  

Scouts need to have camped under canvas for at least two nights (over a weekend) to be in a 
position to understand the answers they may have provided to fulfil the requirements of this 
badge. 

 

 


